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Granite is admired by many homeowners because of its beauty. But while many opt for common types of the
natural stone, you can certainly create a unique feel for your space by choosing exotic granite. Granite
countertops alone will attract attention, but with exotic granite countertops, you can have a surface that is
truly unforgettable and one-of-a-kind. The ‘exotic’ category features many rare granite colors that have
intricate designs. The following are 10 of the best types of exotic granite. 

Best Types of Exotic Granite 

Golden Fantasy Granite 

This elegant granite slab has a brown background and contains highlights of burgundy and gold. If you are
searching for an impressive granite kitchen countertop, this high-quality stone from India can be just what
you are looking for. 

Golden Persa Granite 

The gold, brown and gray tones of this sophisticated natural stone, along with its complex patterns, will
draw attention to any new countertop or backsplash. The stone is quarried in Brazil. 

Exotic Gold Granite 

Exotic Gold granite is just as its name implies – exotic. This magnificent granite is quarried in Italy, and
features patches and veins of purple, brown, black and gray. It is truly one of the most beautiful stone slabs
you can use to complete any kitchen remodel or other home improvement project. 

Juparana Colombo Granite 

The swirls and veins of Juparana Colombo granite complement the beautiful colors that can be seen in the
stone. Gold, gray, red and black blend together in this exotic granite from India. 

Verde Brasiliano Granite 

Verde Brasiliano granite has a green background and deep black veins. This magnificent Brazilian stone is
ideal for kitchen countertops, bathroom vanity tops, backsplashes, fireplace surrounds or outdoor surfaces. 

Altair Granite 
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Altair granite is sure to make a statement wherever it is installed. This exotic natural stone has a black
background accompanied by thick veins of orange, gold and red throughout the slab. 

Lava Jewel Granite 

The reddish-brown background of this amazing Indian granite is complemented by large gray and burgundy
veins. 

Blue Pearl GT Granite 

Blue Pearl GT granite is one of the most elegant slabs you can find. This stone is quarried in Norway and
has a distinctive metallic blue background. 

Blue Bahia Granite 

Blue Bahia granite is one of the highest quality materials in the world. It comes from Brazil and features
white and gold clusters on a blue background. 

Van Gogh Granite 

If you are looking for exotic high-end granite, Van Gogh granite will be just what you are looking for. This
beautiful and artistic natural stone is quarried in Brazil. 
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Does Exotic Granite Cost More Than Other Types? 

Keep in mind that because exotic granite is rare, it will be priced higher than common types of the stone. If
your budget allows (or even if you have to stretch it a little), installing exotic granite in your home can
drastically change the appearance of your space for the better. Any of the stones described above can be the
focal point of the room you install them in. 

Between the beauty, durability and other benefits granite offers, it is one of the best materials you can use in
your home. This guide will help you narrow down your search for the best types of exotic granite you can
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use to complete your home remodeling project.


